


INTERROGATION
QUESTIONS ABOUT EXTRATERRESTRIALS

Hello everybody

I hereby transcribe a series of questions which were asked on the website ‘We are not
alone’ from the winter of 2010 after having released the introduction of my book ‘At the Origin
of All’. This 20-page introduction concerned my strange personal story up to encompass my
relationships with possible extraterrestrials. This publication interlocked with my readers many
relevant questions which went in all directions without having necessarily relations between
them. I transcribe them here in the chronologic order they were asked with my answers tinged
largely by the extraterrestrial entity Naja who expresses himself through me. I have lightly
improved and completed them for  a  better  understanding of  the  topic  covered.  I  do  this
exercise here to demonstrate the regularity and coherence of my testimony since the very
beginning of my public demonstrations. 

I begin…

It has been almost one year that I have not manifested myself but my life is a whirlwind of
which I do not know the reason. However, being again on vacation for 2 months in the south, I
allow myself  to  talk  of  an  event  that  happened to  me this  spring  and which  raises  new
questions in me.

I tell…

I am a teacher of painting in a community center and I am preparing the year end exhibit
(end of April) for about forty students. The preceding Thursday night, due to conflicts with
other professors for the hanging spaces, I have a sleepless night brooding over it (a very rare
fact  for  me).  The  following  day,  starting  at  8:00,  very  busy day,  mounting,  hanging  and
opening to the public until 21:00. Tired, around 22:00, to go back home, I hesitate between
taking the bus (one hour ride as I live in the Montreal center and the community center is in
periphery) or take my scooter (Puch 1978) (three quarters of an hour of travel) as it is raining
a little and there are heavy winds. I decide to take my scooter and here the story turns to the
supernatural.

I  remember the first  10 minutes of the trip and it  is like in a dream, a series of blurry
memories. I fell asleep driving my scooter and I made the rest of the trip (a little bit more than
30 minutes) in a trance. Here is exactly the chronological sequence of bits and pieces of
souvenirs that stayed in my memory. 1: I see at the last minute the back of a parked car which
I try to avoid. 2: I am kneeling on the ground and I pick up red pieces of the car back light and
put them on the bumper knowing that I cannot warn the owner. I hear 2 youngsters on the
other side of the street laughing surely of  my position (not  very charitable).  3:  I  am in a
convenience store asking the cashier where I am and how to get to the center of town (this
road to go to work and come back I have made hundreds of time). 4: I drive as in a fog, I do
not feel my body, nothing, and I say to myself where am I and what am I doing. Then, I start to
concentrate repeating to myself that I am going home. In that trance and blur state, I do not
recognize  any places but  I  force  myself  to  look  at  a  street  sign  that  reassures me as I



recognize the name of the street. 5: My attention is drawn to the noise that my speedometer
makes and it seems out of its base. 6: I see another sign indicating the name of another street
(it is the second most important street I take to get home). 7: I recognize at last the houses
near home. In a concentration effort, I say to myself: Colin, you must open the gate of the
yard with your key, then go in the back, open the door of your locker and store your scooter. I
take time to replace the speedometer, I relock all the doors and enter my apartment located
on the third floor. I say to myself that I must go to bed immediately. While undressing, I notice
that I am hurt on the right knee. I take time to wipe the blood that runs a little and then go to
bed.

The following day,  I  come back to reality.  I  have an injury to  the knee and go to see
immediately if my scooter is not too damaged. It has only a mark on the handlebar and the
speedometer which I fixed the night before is not well aligned.  There!

Hundreds of questions came to mind. Far from being traumatized, I  felt  strong to have
made it  out  but  by what  force? My subconscious,  my superior  self  or  exterior elements?
These bits and pieces of blurred souvenirs as in a dream are all that I remember. I do not
remember, after the accident, to have started my scooter again nor getting on it. I do not
remember to have stopped at red lights, changed streets, stopped at the convenience store,
nor even held my handlebar. I  am convinced that superior forces had gotten involved but
which ones? 

This week there was a certain rebound through a documentary on YouTube. A woman,
abducted many times by extraterrestrials, was telling that she was convinced to have had her
life saved in 3 road accidents thanks to extras She told, among others, that in an accident
where she was stuck in her car and partly unconscious, she had felt the presence of a small
being imposing  his  hands  on  her  to  treat  her  very  damaged  liver  and  stop  an  internal
hemorrhage. In another case, a motorcycle, starting too rapidly, was falling on her but was
shoved aside making a 90 degrees angle. I  do not doubt her testimony but this brings a
question. Why some abductees taken repeatedly and for a long time are protected in a so
precise and individual way? Her story is not unique. What is the interest for extraterrestrials to
have a follow-up so rigorous for many of their human subjects?  Ah!  The nice question! 

Here is my opinion, as I do have one. Here, we go into my personal vision. If you have read
my different posts and testimonies, you know that an extraterrestrial entity expresses himself
through me for several years now (this is told in ‘Story of an Illuminate’). Is this entity my
superior self or likely the memory of an extra implanted in me? According to the researcher
and lecturer Corrado Malanga, the extras use humans to prolong the baggage of life of some
of their congeners who  have no individual survival after death by transplanting it in human
brains. I am deducting that it is for this reason that those selected humans are very precious
for them and overprotected. For Malanga, this manipulation is very negative, near parasitic as
the Alien (film)  and contradicts  the inviolable right  of  an individual.  But,  as his  speech is
without nuance, even very hateful towards the extras and that it does not spare also the other
colleagues with divergent opinions, he is to be put in parentheses.

 Since my individual self uses less than 10% of my brain, maybe there is a place for two.
My guardian angel with whom I do not converse often enough, tells me that the extras are
selfish enough in the sense that they are ready to limit me in many circumstances or stop me
from expressing all my spiritual being potential if this harm their project of an implanted entity.



What to think and do with all this? I could, as many testimonies from abductees, complain the
rest of my life of my poor condition of powerless victim. It is not my way of being a priori and it
would also forget the great teaching I received and uncommon experiences I have lived which
has transformed me for the better over the years. In the future, I will try to know more on that
observation and seek to reconcile this duality in me. It is true that I have always felt protected
even if my human side often felt withdrawn, even harmed, to the benefit of the extra in me.
But I sincerely believe that all has its reason of being and I believe that my adventure has a
sense and benefits all parties. 

I do not exclude also that it is possible that my ‘contactee’ side extrapolates excessively on 
an event that can be explained otherwise.

It is my vision
Colin Christian

Hello everybody

After having read certain written messages from abductees or contactees regarding alert
messages from extraterrestrials that they consider urgent to transmit in turn, I am posting
here a warning. I speak knowingly having received my first messages of disasters in the early
1970’s (I was 18-20 years old).

You have to know, first, that this is part of an intervention protocol well defined by senior
leaders of extraterrestrial races that are watching us. Let me explain. It was agreed, among
other  things,  at  high  level  that  each  individual  approached  or  abducted would  receive  a
message well defined, always the same, with little or no possibility of transforming it. Basically
and from memory, it consists of this: You have been chosen; your planet is in danger; risk of
world  war;  planetary  cataclysm;  end  of  your  race  and  possibly  of  your  world.  Send  this
message.  Sometimes  (as  They  know that  we  are  emotional  beings),  it  is  shown  strong
images of disasters on what COULD happen if… (and not what WILL happen). In summary
(and this took me many years to understand),  this message was not addressed to me in
particular but was transmitted to all  contacted persons who were in a state to  receive it;
meaning not in a state of shock. These first transmitted messages are, in a unique sense,
(strict procedure) as They do not expect answers from our part and mostly the extraterrestrial
kidnappers are trained performers for this and have little game of maneuver or improvisation.
So, do not spend all your savings to publish the message the quickest way possible as you
think there is urgency!  Me, I did it 40 years ago already! I had the chance to have a brother
who had a little printing studio. Today, looking back, I think that I had at that time the ardor of
the missionary but also the naivety of youth.

Those same messages of awareness to our destiny are diffused by Them, all around the
earth, on frequencies which can be picked up by any psychologically sensitive being which
explains the telepathic contactees. The extras do this on planets that need a little help or as in
our case, when it is a question of survival. But it is a little more complex than that because
these messages are accompanied by rains of growth; poetic term from their parts to describe
the diffusion of very specific waves which promote the awakening of consciousness.

Know also  that  after  this  first  stage  of  general  influence  is  over,  if  you  have,  as  an
individual, a serious desire to undertake a dialogue with Them, it is possible that they answer



your questions. The extras will then be able to give you more realistic answers on the real
situation.  But  They will  answer  you always in  a  manner satisfying  you immediately while
taking into consideration your ability to understand. They are bound to influence us in the
evolutionary sense even if sometimes they can use small lies as we do it a little ourselves
with our own children. All action that would put in danger the psychic balance of an individual
is as possible to be prohibited but nobody can control entirely the impact of their actions on
the other.

A long time ago, in my youth, I  thought I  was an ‘elected’ but now, I  do not have my
suitcase near my front door anymore, in case… It is well in the back of a closet. But the extras
continue to speak and to guide me on demand. When They sense that I have progressed
somewhat by myself, They operate different transformations in me that accelerate even more
my evolution. If I do not behave too much like a child (which is a feature of my personality),
They confide to me things reserved to adults and preferably, to those who are open to the
universe. 

So, an advice from an old contactee to young contactees:  Do not take all these messages
to the first degree and do not be too quick to go on a crusade to convert the planet but ask
instead, for messages that will concern your own evolution. They will be happy to help you.
Your progress will reflect surely, sooner or later, on the whole.

P.S:  It has been a long time since I have not asked myself any more questions on what is
true or false, real or not. It is the greatest loss of time than to want to validate everything,
prove or confirm all.  The day when I  understood that all  information that puzzled me, all
sensation that made me vibrate and all experience that made me grow, that was enough for
me as proof of its legitimacy in my life. I then went from the stage of natural evolution to that
of the revolution of being. 

You can, of course, react to my comments.

It is my opinion
Colin Christian

Question from Einstein

Why the extras do not come to see people in a more direct and more efficient manner?  It 
would be in their interest and maybe in ours. If they are able to contact us, could they not say 
to those they contact how to contact them?

Hello Einstein

  To understand the principle  of  direct  non-interference from ETs,  you must  compare the
situation to your own way of managing your different communities. No individual on earth can
travel from one country to another without explaining, even slightly at the borders,  the reason
of this intrusion to thus obtain an authorization or not. It  is again more important when it
means for an individual  or even a people to directly interfere in the operation of another
country.



The rest of the universe functions identically. It is not an immense chaos. Races potentially
evolved on many neighbouring planets end up by uniting in federations governed by common
laws  or  I  would  say,  by  a  code  of  honor  accepted  and  respected  by  the  whole.  These
federations can unite in even more imposing confederations which can cover vast territories.
In general, it is the ambient air identical to a group of worlds that creates the affiliation. It
means that those vibratory scales and the abundance or scarcity of the primary essence in
the environment create natural barriers that are difficult to cross and then limit the movements
and associations from one world to another. These federations are required to respect the
decisions taken by each people of a planet and cannot intervene in a conflict only if there is a
request or if the conflict exceeds the boundaries of the planet. This is again more real for
worlds which are not on the official territory of a federation. Some federations are however
explorers of new worlds and stimulators of life.

But here is the problem. Those who created and implanted you on earth have done it let’s
say ‘illegally’ without all ‘official’ agreements as your system is not part of their jurisdiction.
They have not only given life but actually have implanted it many times. The reason of their
action was a question of survival for them. All is told in detail in the rest of my book ‘At the
Origin of All’. Then, after many rebounds on many millennia, it was forbidden by some high-
placed authorities that all  new direct  interventions on earth would be forbidden till  further
notice. This ban is still in force. If there are extras that contact certain governments, either
they do it illegally or they are not aware, at first glance, of this ban. There is a bit of vagrancy
even in the universe.

So what is allowed at this moment as intervention is what is quoted in my first post. Also, to
our great misfortune, it  is imposed on official  extras not to leave any direct trace of their
presence. Here is a simple example drawn from my case that happened a while ago. For
those  who  have  read  my  story,  at  the  famous  hypnosis  session  where  the  entity  Naja
manifested himself for the first time through me, the session of 4 hours was recorded on two
cassettes of 1:30 hour each. The conversation is audible in the first cassette but the second
one has a static (parasite) so high that my words are completely incomprehensible. I want to
point out that all was recorded with a good microphone, a good quality recorder and all this
done  in  a  closed  room  without  windows.  During  the  whole  session,  I  stayed  sensibly
conscious and it seems from memory that the revelations were not too incriminatory. Anyway,
two hypotheses come to mind. Either at that time I began already to disrupt the electrical
devices as today sometimes with computers or maybe they went to great lengths so there is
no embarrassing trace left: Not to ‘amuse’ themselves with me as a cat with a mouse but
because it is a decree of high authority that they must respect imperatively.

Sorry if  I  am talkative  but  there  are  not  too  many sites  that  give  me this  freedom of
expression. Maybe I am also a bit too affirmative and direct but I have the merit at least of not
staying in the evasive. Such as: Hello! I am a contactee, I receive messages but I cannot talk.

    It is my vision
    Colin Christian

    Einstein

   Already, I am looking forward to the end of your testimony and then you say that the ETs
have an interdiction of direct contact but how long does this interdiction last? 2 days? 10



years? A billion years?

    Well, me, I would not say I am jealous but on what criteria do They choose the persons
they contact?

   
    As we can read it in your story with Naja, you have a rather heavy past living your previous
lives.

    But after, I would like to take the problem backwards. Why if ‘I’ would want to get in contact
with Them, could They not simply be able to give me this boost in order to ‘debate’?  As you
so rightly said:  It is pointless to go on a crusade to convert the whole planet.

 For the persons who would be volunteers to at least help, how to do this? Surely, we could
arrive at a concept of information exchange (as you said, they filter quite a lot), but at least,
we would show that we care about this small planet (even though the Mars planet has always
attracted me).

     Question from Azimut

     Hello Colin Christian, I have many questions:

     Do they intend to intervene in order to save us before we self-destruct?

     If so, what do they intend to do exactly? 

     Why can’t we join their alliance? Is it because we are illegal at the base?

 Hello everybody
   
     I will attempt to answer all your questions but I am a bit limited as I type on the keyboard
with two fingers at a time only. Also, if I answer with a certain delay, it is because in the small
village where I am on vacation at this moment in the south, the internet does not work every
day. As usual, my language will be direct and without hesitation. It is because I am only a
transmitter who applies himself to remove as much as possible the filters between Them and
me. So, in fact, I don’t think too much about what I write (strange sentence). It is for that
reason that I always sign ‘It is my vision’ on top of my name to temper the content of my
messages.

It would also be good to read my other interventions on different subjects in other posts
which can contain relevant information. The story of an illuminate (at the beginning of my
book ‘At the Origin of All’) well describes my adventure in the paranormal field and the more
voluminous sequel of my book is the long story of the extraterrestrial entity that expresses
himself through me. His baggage of knowledge is a huge amount of information to understand
Them (see on my site; cosmologie-extraterrestre.com). 

I will try answering to Einstein on the possible duration of the interdiction of direct contact
with extras. You have to understand that this interdiction coming from high ranking entities
was issued a long time ago (over 200 thousand years) at  a time when your whole solar



system was living disruptions that threatened other worlds around. That could have improved
but  the  game has unfortunately changed since you  have started recently to  use nuclear
power.  The risk of  a  major  large-scale disruption,  which I  explain  in  another  post,  is  the
reason (read my text ‘Why, the extraterrestrials…’) On top of the interdiction of direct contact,
you  were  quarantined  along  with  your  whole  solar  system.  You  are  not  aware  that  you
threaten,  with  your  nuclear  experiments,  the  life  of  a  whole  ecosystem which  goes  well
beyond your planet:  As in a sick body, the cancerous cells should be isolated so they do not
spread to other healthy parts. The universe is a celestial body which cannot afford to live
under constant threat of a harmful propagation. It is the best comparison that I could use. So,
the communication ways in both directions are cut and will be re-established only when all
possibilities of massive destruction will  be totally eliminated. Then, we will  be able to talk
contacts and exchanges. The extras can contain, limit up to a certain point the earthlings in
their awkwardness if this threatens a more vast territory but cannot force them to change their
behavior because of the obligation to respect the honor code of non-interference.

We understand that many earthlings are marvelous beings and deserve our respect and
this is for that reason that we continue to protect and do everything so that no catastrophe
happens.  We  protect  you  against  yourselves  and  unfortunately  also,  if  needed,  despite
yourselves. Under many levels, you are our ‘illegitimate children’ that we cannot abandon. But
because of all your politics, still too primitive, we cannot think at this moment of integration
into our federation.

For Lemulot who would love to meet them and learn a few tips, know that it is difficult for
me to answer this question because in my case, I do not believe having wanted this. There
surely  was  an  important  reason  for  that  contact  which  I  just  began  to  understand  only
recently.  I  will  tell  you a secret,  don’t  tell  anybody.  Harmonium, in  one of  his  messages,
slipped a word of it. (I could not find his post). Some humans would be the reincarnation or
the extension of extraterrestrial entities from the past that the extras from today are able to
locate. They do not want to lose their life experiences nor their knowledge which could be for
Them a precious inheritance of their own history. It is one of the reasons for the tracking of
many earthlings along with the one for the genetic and vibratory quality of some in relation to
the original creation. What comes out of this finding, it is that an extra entity does not express
himself through me, it is me, only more vast. This is what has made me interesting for Them.
How many humans are in the same situation without being conscious of it or only partially; but
I do not ask myself too many questions on the other types of contactees.  

All this to tell you that we cannot contact them only out of curiosity or for a simple desire of
evasion. You will  understand that they consider the situation to be serious and they are not
here as tourists ready to sympathize with each and every one. Nevertheless, if  a have a
suggestion to make to meet them, the first condition is to find the wavelength, the frequency
on which they issue their warning messages and if you begin to pick them up, maybe they will
notice you at the end of the line. If not, you simply have to start an inner true dialogue with
Them while gazing at a spot in a starry sky and this being done wi thout expectation. You must
only do it while specifying well your intentions and with the sincere desire to opening up to
something greater. I’m sorry but right now, that is all I can say on how to contact them. But
with the thorough reading of my first book, a click can occur which will lend to a trail to follow. 

To answer to Azimut on a possible self-destruction, all the potential solutions have been
discussed concerning their intervention. The absolute control of all nuclear on earth by them



is a thing done.  I repeat a very serious sentence I said in another post ‘If the extraterrestrials
had not indirectly intervened all along these last years to repair the ‘awkwardness’ of humans,
there would be no more form of life on earth actually’. The direct interventions are planned as
a last resort only like your total extermination was examined also as an extreme solution. But,
do you now understand why this will not be done as your patrimony should be saved as one
splendid race with an immense potential. All  possible interventions have been explored and
all were put in place as a precaution. It is up to you to determine the outcome.

You have been created of a rare perfection (but not yet realized) and put on a planet not
being in a sector of the universe which could favour entirely your full development. We also
can make mistakes and since this sector is not under our jurisdiction, we do not have the right
to directly intervene unless the reason is very important, indeed vital and mostly approved by
our superiors. Other less evolved federations (more prone to the submission of people) may
claim these locations because your planetary system is situated in their sector. But this claim
is  stopped  at  the  moment  because  our  rights  and  obligations  towards  you  have  been
maintained by superior races.

You are then a special case and to tell you the truth, even if your departure into that world
was a ‘mistake’, your evolution interests lots of people since it is a matter of knowing if the
complex life,  suitable to build civilizations, can prosper in remote corners of the universe,
even hostile at first glance. Your history already serves as an example to consider in the
future to dare attempt the same experience in worlds still evolving.

In conclusion, if you are not concerned directly by this whole story, live in peace in your
everyday life and do your best daily for the survival of your planet. It is not asked more of you.
For  others,  I  hope  to  have  shed  some  light  a  little,  otherwise,  I  will  answer  your  new
questions.

Question from Azimut

A big thank you for your answers Colin Christian!

Since you seem to know a lot, can I ask you a large number of questions coming to my
head? (For many years I have been passionate about the ETs). Thank you very much.

Reflection from Thib7

I will probably look skeptical but all this seems a bit too detailed to be true…

Hello everybody

I would like, first, to answer to the reflection from Thib7 which is commendable and which I
had suspected would come inexorably. Can a text appear false because it is too precise as
for  the  opposite,  can a text  too  blurry  be  also  false? Is  there  a middle  ground between
unequivocal affirmation and systematic doubt which would be more credible to some. It is
normal in a discussion on a subject to issue opinions, reservations and even contrary points
of view but here, we talk about testimony. All right, it is a hypothetical entity of extraterrestrial
origin who expresses himself through me but in any event, he tells about his experiences on
subjects he knows.  Naja will  not  put  before each sentence expressions of  these types:  I



believe having lived…It seems to me having felt…I doubt but I am not sure that…This would
make his testimony heavier and I do not know anyone who tells his experiences that way
except if there is a precise doubt to be formulated on an item in particular. I know this can
surprise that I am able to testify this way but having written numerous texts, it is all natural
and self-evident for me. After 40 years of this type of inner dialogue, I am no longer at the
period of the neophyte scepticism.

Someone I had accepted to tell a part of my story asked me, one day, if the fact to be of a
solitary nature, to have a lot of imagination and feel different, could it have brought me to
believe that I was in contact with extraterrestrials? I answered, maybe, as I do not exclude
any hypothesis. However, if it was the contrary; if it was because they have contacted me that
I became solitary with time, that I have visions and I feel different.

It must also be understood that it has been a long time ago that I have passed the stage to
always  want  to  find  proofs  of  my every discoveries  and reflections.  I  have  replaced the
concept of what is true versus what is false, by the one that all is true. Everything we imagine
exists already in the universe because our brain, made with the same matter as the universe,
can imagine only possibilities already included in the creation. Our potential and our limits are,
first,  commensurate with our endorsed body vehicles and our place of residence for now.
Then,  secondly,  we  have  as  perspective  of  imagination  the  whole  universe  and  what  it
contains of choices and experiences. All our beliefs help to be able to function in a place, at a
given time and in a precise circumstance. It is the truth of the moment. All truth becomes
false, or I could say, becomes less true by the discovery of a truth more adapted to new
parameters of our lives. If the being is really evolving, each new truth will be broader than the
preceding one and will encompass it. Adoring the sun as a god does not become false when
we discover that the whole universe is divine.

I made a major evolutionary leap when I understood that all  personal experience or all
testimony of another which touched sensitive chords in me was enough to dwell on it.  What
was important, it is that the results brought me in a state of consciousness opening without
telling me if it was true or false as we can evolve either in reading a true story as well as a
fictional one. It is a loss of precious time to want to prove everything. For the other truths
which leave me indifferent, I do not judge them as false but irrelevant for my actual evolution.

If what I tell is too precise and is told in an affirmative tone, I am sorry but that is part of the
way Naja expresses himself. Me, Colin, I can express reservations on the content but that
would not add anything useful to the comments as Naja testifies of his experiences, that’s all.
He has no doubts about himself or his life experiences and if what he says is a hypothesis, he
will say it. Be sure also that if Naja does not know the subject of a question, he will not invent
just to make himself interesting. He is well enough already (humor). I am very conscious that
as Colin, I have my own personality and I could tinge the texts beyond measure but it has
been a long time since he did not have to rap me over the knuckles. At the beginnings of our
relation,  when  I  was  fiddling  his  words  to  do  well,  he  would  systematically  correct  me.
Nevertheless, I must say that as Naja is a part of me and our personalities intermingle, the
tests are often written with an intertwining of me, him and Them. I sometimes also make
corrections so that it is not entirely written from the pen of Naja as not to perturb you too
much. So, the source of the comments must appear sometimes a little blurred I might add
(humor).



To answer to new questions from Azimut and Einstein, I am applying myself but I did not
have any feedback as to know if some of you have begun to read the whole story of Naja. In
the complete book, many of your questions find their answers and in detail. Azimut, almost
half of your questions have an answer inside. Even if the whole story of Naja would be a pure
invention of my too fertile brain,  this would not  take away the charm of the story nor its
possibility to make you evolve. In any case, I will answer your questions at my turtle pace.

It is my vision
Colin Christian

Hello everybody
    
    Hello  Azimut
   

All your questions have excited my neurons and indirectly, the entity who expresses himself
through me. It is no said that I will be able to redo this exercise often but here is what we think
of it. Those who have read my texts up to date have understood that I use an affirmative tone
of language not to seem owner of the truth but that it is my way of expressing. It is because I
have great respect for those who have created this site which allows too many people to
express  themselves  freely  and  intelligently  that  I  let  also  myself  transmit  a  part  of  my
knowledge gained. You can, without any problem, consider it only as hypothesis. Its goals are
to just let you see my vision. You are free to accept it or not. If my hypotheses resonate a
sensitive chord in you, so much the better.

Question from Azimut.

    What did they think of Fukushima? Have they made any decisions following this event?

Naja

The control of armament and nuclear installations on earth by the extraterrestrials is total. It
is not the first planet nor the first civilization to discover the nuclear and minimize their risks.
So, it has been a long time since the extras have developed a whole arsenal to control this
dangerous power. Without this absolute control installed more than 40 years ago here, there
would actually be no more form of life on earth. We have lost count of the interventions by
Them to minimize the damages. Many examples abound in this direction. Testimonies from
American ex-militaries, accessible on the internet, describe the flights of UFO over their bases
causing  the  complete  deactivation  at  distance  of  all  the  nuclear  missile  heads.  At  the
Tchernobyl incident, the core of the reactor was ready to melt down, evidence of an eminent
explosion  which  would  have thrown a  radioactive  cloud over  a  great  part  of  Europe but
‘miraculously’  the  process  was  stopped  in  progress.  The  technicians  congratulated
themselves to have avoided the worst without taking into account the UFO that flew over the
site.  The  extras  have  often  absorbed  the  fumes  of  atomic  bomb explosions  to  limit  the
disastrous consequences. The scientists, too sure of themselves, perceive only a biased facet
of their experiments. And here’s the problem!  By putting out secretly so many fires lit by
children playing with matches, adults end up making them believe that their actions are not
that serious. The more the extraterrestrials repair the blunders of earthlings, the more these
allow themselves to take risks. Will it take, as at Fukushima, to let the situations degenerate
enough to scare really the unconscious and reckless and indirectly, also incite the populations



to react? But the extras have considered many other alternatives before jeopardizing the lives
of people. I explain to where the nuclear risks go in the section; your theories ‘Do not read this
if you are a believer like me’ transcribed in my text ‘Why so many extraterrestrial and spiritual
beings are interested in us’.

Question from Azimut.

Why in UFO crashes, the extras do not hurry to retrieve the debris so to avoid certain
proofs?

The extras do it when they can but do not consider it relevant to risk a confrontation with
militaries  for  debris  or  even  a  whole  flying  engine.  Some extraterrestrials  have  a  fragile
constitution  in  our  atmosphere  and  fear  the  unpredictable  and  violent  roughness  of  our
soldiers.  For  the  extraterrestrial  peoples  I  know,  their  vessels  are  of  a  difficult  nature  to
understand for earthlings, even less for militaries (joke). They are made of a half-mineral, half-
biological  material,  in the proportions varying from one vessel  to  another  and having the
particularity to be equipped with a certain consciousness meaning intelligence with a certain
autonomy. Broken or dismembered gravely,  as an animal,  their  state brings a quite  rapid
disaggregation of those which are most biological or a state of calcification for those which
are most mineral. This context makes them hardly usable or fixable because they don’t have
their original properties anymore which take out also their exceptional quality as proof. For the
complete crashes of vessels, without the frequencies emanating from their real conductor, it is
almost impossible to get the least reaction. Nevertheless, even if they are still in working order
at their capture, they are ‘programmed’ to be sensitive to good intentions as well as bad ones
and  react  consequently.  They  can  become  inert,  in  other  words,  play  dead.  They  are
considered alive by the extras. I can compare this for you to a cowboy on his horse living a
partnership. This reflection relates to races evolved enough to master the manipulation of the
conscious matter.

Question from Azimut.

Are the Men in black extraterrestrial entities? Who are they? Where do they live?

Naja

Never having discussed this with Colin, I am unable to transmit the information which is too
weird for his abilities.

Question from Azimut.

Who was Jesus and God? What were their goals?

Naja

I  can  only  say this:  Jesus  at  the  origin  was  a  man like  any other,  born  normally  but
extremely curious and quick-witted. It is with time that he sought to understand more and
more mysteries up to the whole reason of life. This has brought him to be interested and open
to different beliefs through initiations. He was rewarded one day of his efforts by the fact that a
superior extraterrestrial entity revealed himself in him and has propelled him to a very high



level of  knowledge and abilities.  He was then called Jesus Christ  because of this double
identity. This text only unveils a little and it is wanted this way for the moment. 

What is the definition of God? I will be a little more serious and give details to say to you
what the extraterrestrials I know have explained to me as to what they have discovered on the
concept  of  God.  For  them,  ALL that  exists  in  the  universe  comes from and  is  made  of
essence, a single and unique primary energy which,  in reflecting on itself,  has created a
multitude  of  vibrations.  Those  vibrations,  by  turning  on  themselves,  have  formulated  a
multitude of envelopes which have defined all that exists in the known universe including all
the  possible  frequency plans.  They consider  that  primary energy as  divine  because it  is
indestructible, hence eternal and immutable.  It can transform, adapt, become more complex
in  its  manifestations  but  it  never  loses its  primary quality to  be  eternal  therefore  without
beginning or end. On the basis of this finding, they have discovered that the black holes in the
center of each galaxy were that highly concentrated energy which orchestrated the gyratory
movements of each galaxy and that the dark matter present in the whole universe was in fact
also that energy in a pure state (without form). After, they discovered a gigantic black hole at
the center of the universe which governed the global whole. While comparing their discovery
with the functioning of their own entity, they have come to the conclusion, with evidence, that
the whole universe was a gigantic living organism, conscious and that we therefore live in it
but  at  a microscopic level.  That gigantic organism can be called,  with good reason, God
because we depend on him; it is him who insufflates our conscience to exist and in return, we
give a sensory perception of his universe from within. From that derive the sentences as ‘We
have been created in his likeness’  ‘God is everywhere and in us’. We are ourselves a God for
all forms of life which inhabit us and which constitute our entity. It is a perfect symbiosis where
benefits accrue to each party. For God, we are very important because we are his internal
senses that permanently transmit information which allows him to be conscious of himself. I
believe  that  you  are  perspective  enough  to  make  all  possible  analogies  between  your
personal universe and the entire universe. In my book ‘At the Origin of All’, the subject is well
explained. If you take the time to read it carefully, all the questions described above on God
receive information thanks to discoveries made by certain extraterrestrial peoples. They are
not  necessarily absolute  truths  but  positive  concepts  usable  in  your  day-to-day life  for  a
greater well-being.

Question from Azimut.

What will happen the day the universe will be closed in on itself? (The big crunch). Have
the ETs found an emergency solution?

Naja

   If I understand your question well, you refer to  the opposite phenomena of the big bang.
First, the concept of the big bang for the extras is not very credible because it starts from the
premise that if  the universe is in expansion, it  is because there has been at the point of
departure an explosion. This is the conclusion of their research. They are convinced that the
expansion of the universe is due to the same phenomena as we live in our physical body. It is
the breathing of a gigantic being in the making. When we inhale, the air penetrates in us and
our rib cage takes expansion and when we exhale, the air is expelled and our body contracts.
The universe has, in its center, an immense primary energy source which in deploying and
coming back on itself, has created all form of matter. This movement is so  slow that it can



only be calculated with a certain vertigo. Therefore, the universe is in the process of inhaling
at this moment because the matter is in expansion while its energy is coming back to its
center. Returned to its limit of expansion, it will  expire and its energy will  deploy while its
matter will come back towards its center. This will go up to a certain concentration of all form
of matter which will define it in a stable space without dying or being destroyed. It will simply
be  more  compact.  There  will  be  a  downtime  period  equal  to  the  time  of  the  two  other
phenomena, laying down life as in a state of rest and the three cycles will start again.

The  analogy of  the  breathing  in  three  steps  of  any living  being  is  not  fortuitous.  We
originate from this universe and we are then its replica at a tiny scale. We live in the inside of
a hardly measurable being in size and unimaginable in its global appearance. But what is
certain, it is not ready to die out because we are living at this moment in a long  colossal
inhalation of this God-universe. This will be followed by a gigantic exhalation and of course,
with many other cycles of breathing. For those who have a vivid imagination, know that the
extras suspect that he may not be the only one of its kind.

Question from Azimut.

Does there exist anything after life? (If yes, can we meet extraterrestrials there? Will I see
again people from my entourage who are deceased?)

Naja

The whole concept of survival after death, according to the extras, is largely detailed in
many pages of my manuscript “At the Origin of All” and this in its simplest implications. For
Them, it has been a long time since these concepts are not just beliefs but rather actual facts
resulting from their serious scientific research. However, you must know that some of their
discoveries could surprise you, even shock some and even consequently upset their actual
beliefs. Thus, to read with an open mind.  

Question from Azimut.

Do the pyramids have anything to do with the ETs?

Naja

That  subject  was  addressed  by  me in  the  post  ‘The  sphinx  and  its  mysteries’  in  the
category ‘Construction and antique artefacts’. I would add, following this testimony, that many
pyramids  were,  originally,  energy  generators  (non-electric)  which  could  supply  different
sophisticated equipment of extraterrestrial origin. But then, with the loss of the real knowledge
of  their  functioning and the disappearance of  tools  that  they supplied,  their  constructions
became more symbolic than utilitarian.

Here is however the full transcript of my intervention on the subject.

The sphinx and the pyramids have always fascinated, throughout time, those who have



contemplated  them.  Their  enigmatic  origins  gave  rise  to  all  possible  speculations  which
certain are closer to the truth and others, wander from it. I will give you my version and you
can do with it as you please.

The sphinx already existed, more than 14000 years ago and was a vestige of a previous
civilization  even  before  the  coming  of  the  Atlantean  people  in  these  regions.  I  have  no
memory that there were other functions than to testify of the grandeur of a culture which
reached its peak during the era of the Lion; as the symbol of Taurus, Aries and even Pisces
will be for many peoples that will follow in the subsequent eras.

The Atlanteans, which I know more about, prepared themselves at that time to a planetary
catastrophe. They suspected then that their place of residence would be ruined in the waters.
They decided to transport their knowledge and technology, among others, in that region of the
Nile that they determined stable enough. During this period, that territory which is part of the
actual Egypt, had a rather lush vegetation favorable to the emergence of a prosperous new
era. Expecting the worst, some underground spaces were built to house what they had the
most  precious,  the  archives  of  their  history,  the  most  beautiful  art  works  and  their
sophisticated equipment including even flying engines of small and middle sizes.

The orbit  of the earth on its axis had for a long time a weakness which brought it,  at
approximately every 15000 years, to undergo an imbalance, bringing a whole lot of upheaval
followed with a readjustment. As expected, a series of planetary catastrophes followed by
torrential rains struck the world. There were at least 500 years of turbulence before a certain
climatic stability was established. That long difficult passage had the effect of demoralizing the
survivors and a good part of the knowledge including the use and repair of their technology
got lost in progeny.

It  was then decided, before the few remaining resources would disappear, to construct
several pyramids in particular places of the earth to at last stabilize its axis and for a long
period. It was a request becoming urgent by the people still traumatized by all these endless
climatic ordeals. The leaders could only comply because their roles were to be, most of all, at
the service of their people. It is strange for me that you have thought for a long time and still
today that a pharaoh could be so megalomaniac as to sacrifice thousands of lives to construct
buildings dedicated to his own glory or to receive his remains. Nevertheless, the vestiges of
technologic instruments still operating at that time were sufficient for the realization of that
project.

In  the  comments  on  that  post,  this  hypothesis  does  not  seem  to  have  been  raised.
Nevertheless,  in  the  years  70 and 80,  many marginal  and eccentric  were  having  fun by
building pyramids with all kinds of materials and of different sizes. The result was sensibly
always the same; they would attract and focus on energy in its center which had the property
of being revitalizing. We could put inside perishable goods that, as a result, had their duration
of life prolonged; some would put old rusty razor blades which would get a second life. All
sorts of experiences like these were done by individuals to prove the potential of the energy
concentrator of the pyramids of all kinds. If this works on a small level, you can only imagine
the colossal capacities of a pyramid like Khéops; and it was well  this primary function for
which it was built. Its precise dimension is to the extent of its role facing the earth. In a few
words,  it  was an immense sensor  and accumulator of  revitalizing energy which,  if  it  was
working well, was then directed towards the telluric veins of the earth which are close, under



the  surface.  Combined  with  many  other  pyramids  wisely  distributed,  that  reinforced
automatically the balance and the stability of the whole planet.

If  they were useful for other functions afterwards, I  don’t doubt it;  like make believe to
decadent leaders, usurping the noble title of pharaoh, that they could prolong their lives and
even achieve immortality by exposing themselves to radius in the central part. It had been a
long time that, at the core of certain of these pyramids, the condenser did not function any
more or had been destroyed. With the deterioration of the exterior coating which served to
attract and retain the energies, that made several even less efficient.

No need for thousands of slaves with torturers for their constructions. A device type, still
usable at that time and which we could call ‘magnetic repulsor’, had the capacity of capturing
the frequency of a mass and by the tuning of its opposite frequency could raise it and push it
in front of you. Do not ask me the real way of its operation because I do not know more. Like
most of you, I am not a technician even if I can use every day a technology that is beyond me.
Different formats of that device served for different weights of objects up to being able to
move a big section of a mountain. But these devices also ended up not functioning anymore
because of the lack of understanding of their internal mechanisms and therefore how to repair
them.

I also remember that many peoples, afterwards, have attempted, by the sweat of their
brow, to build constructions more or less similar to those of the Atlanteans. It was in the hope
of rebuilding a lost golden age but still well alive in the collective memory. They remembered
vaguely  the  fabulous  powers  of  these  titanic  buildings.  They  were  convinced  that  their
realization, how painful they may be, would guarantee them a radius of energy around that
would protect and strengthen their civilization which was partially true.

In closing, if a barrier is built around these vestiges, you can be sure that the discovery is
colossal.  This  had  never  been  done  before  according  to  my  knowledge  on  any  other
archaeological site. With all the technology of today to sound the seabed and the depths of
the soil, nothing in the sands at that place must have any secrets at this time. Most of the
devices  originally  buried  before  the  disaster,  were  used  afterwards  and  have  then  been
destroyed with time. But what is still left must be significant. If this was possible, I would like to
retrieve my personal vessel which must still function even after all these years. No matter how
hard they would try to get in and make it work, no use, it is me who has the key (humor).

Colin

   That was a beautiful story that I have transcribed. I do not control the source that dictated it
to me, just a little the hand handling the pen.

In America (places of  all  extremes,  from strict  conservatism to liberalism without  limit),
there are a few archaeologists  who are not  afraid to associate themselves with  sensitive
mediums for help in their excavations on historic sites. The mediums, while wandering on the
premises or in touching certain artefacts, can feel and even visualize the whole framework of
an  ancient  period.  That  can  include  houses  in  their  original  state,  inhabitants  with  their



clothing, their daily lifestyle and can even feel their experience from within. This sharing with
archaeologists  can  help  them to  advance  more  rapidly  in  their  research  and  thus  avoid
tedious  years  in  exploring  too  many  useless  avenues.  It  goes  without  saying  that  the
testimony of the mediums is perceived as a precious help, even a serious lead but not as
finality,  a  conclusion  in  itself.  It  is  a  job  that  I  would  have  liked  to  have  done.  Not  the
archaeologist one, the other.

The conclusion of the documentary-film ‘The revelation of the pyramids’ (which I greatly
appreciated) is that the ring of pyramids around the earth would be a warning (under the form
of an immense clock) of a possible episodic catastrophe due to the displacing of magnetic
poles. This hypothesis-conclusion is true because any object rotating in an angle not perfectly
vertical  (as a  spinning  top which  starts  to  incline more and more)  end up by bringing  a
complete tilting. The earth has sustained many failovers of that type in the past (around one
every 20 thousand years) but what is not said nor expected in that film, is that in addition to
being a huge complex to warn us of a future catastrophe, that is also its solution. This ring of
pyramids (gigantic condenser of energy which is insufflated after into the veins of the earth)
was built to solve the problem by stabilizing the axis of the earth and not only to warn the
people  of  the future.  This  project  was colossal  for  that  reason.  The earthlings forget  the
enormous importance of mountain chains on the stability of rotation of a planet.

    Question from Azimut.

Have the ETs ever prevented us from an invasion by defending us against other races?

Naja

Yes. (Concise answer). Topic covered in another of my writing.

Question from Azimut.

What is the resource used by the ETs to travel?

Naja

The extras I know use two principal propulsion means. But I’ve got to inform you that no
extensive scientific notion is accessible to me without a great effort due to the fact of my
formation  and  culture.  I  can  simply  say that  they use,  for  long  distance  travel,  currents
circulating throughout the universe which connect numerous key points. These currents have
been mostly mapped with time and the extras have learned to use them without making any
effort to propel themselves inside except for controlling the speed which can be vertiginous in
some of these paths. Your birds going without effort from an air current to another by gliding
are a good comparison.  Some highly evolved beings can also use stars to  make almost
instant transportation between them because they are connected by hyper powerful currents.
Their understanding and uses go with the acceptation that the universe is a gigantic being
and, as us, it is permeated by fluids and energetic currents connected by vital points (places
of transit). The study of Chinese acupuncture is also a good approach for understanding the
phenomena.

The second means of propulsion which is for short distances and for a more precise control



of their movements is based on the attractions and repulsions of magnetic fields. By their
controls, they can use all large targeted masses and thereafter, choose to move away from
them or go near. Whether it  is a planet, a mountain or a large boulder, they tune into its
frequency and then play with its attraction or repulsion. But all this is done in a rapid and
spontaneous way by the intelligence of the vessels. The conductor establishes an intimate
connection with his device and the driving is more a matter of feeling than of an activated
handle. (Colin) I admit that I am quite ignorant for all that is going on inside our technologic
devices; a fortiori on those of the extras as I do not have the vocabulary or brain trained for it.

Question from Azimut.

How did they succeed in developing without killing each other and dealing with pollution? 

Naja

First, you must know that the whole universe comes from a single essence/energy which
has adopted all the forms we know. This essence is thus present everywhere in the universe
as the basic informal state and formal by vibratory shock. Nevertheless, it is more abundant in
general near the central source of many galaxies. What you call black holes and can be found
at the center of each galaxy is the strongest concentration (outside the mega black hole at the
center of our known universe). On the other hand, it is less and less abundant when we move
away from these centers; as in your planetary system which is in periphery of your galaxy. All
this to tell you that the world of extras I know is born in an ambient air where that energy was
more abundant which allowed these peoples to start their civilization to a level that we could
qualify of already advanced; as that substance, even at the almost informal state, has the
propriety of conveying information, consciousness, wisdom emitted by all forms of lives and at
the same time penetrate easily with that baggage all other conscious lives. It is difficult to
describe all the qualities of that essence. In a few words, the more abundant it is in the air, the
more  it  promotes  awareness  and  by  fluid  exchanges,  it  accelerates  evolution.  Its
concentration also ensures that there is less difference and distance between beings and thus
their envelopes are more permeable to influences.

Certain peoples have even learned to concentrate this essence ‘artificially’ around their
world to stabilize at first their moods, control their defects, diseases, undesirable behaviours
and protect also their planet from the sometimes hostile exterior environment. Afterwards,
they have been able to accelerate, in a major way, their evolution at all levels. Nevertheless,
there is always a risk of being too disconnected from its real habitat; in other words from the
specific position of their world in space. It is not always easy to find the balance between
discovery and integration. There are civilizations being born in worlds where the basic energy
is so abundant that they already have, at the starting point, a high level of perfection. Only the
desire of some peoples or individuals to descend into darker worlds (further from the center)
will make them aware of all the errors which are unfortunately devolved. My answer might be
incomplete because I could have talked of these peoples I know which have gone through the
same challenges as you have and come out of it.

I have not answered all the questions asked but, mainly, those that caught my attention
and of course, in the way I saw fit. I give myself the liberty of choosing. My writing will space
for a while as,  after two months of vacation,  I  return to class next Monday (professor of
painting). This will give you a rest from my interventions. 



It is my vision
Colin Christian

Reflection from Esech

Hello Colin

  I  understand  some  things  you  are  saying  and  they  are  confirmed  also  internally.
Nevertheless,  if  I  may,  is  it  not  a  bit  reductive  than  to  say  that  all  contactees  receive
necessarily  the  same  message?  Are  all  the  contactees  sensibly  at  the  same  levels  of
elevation? Is it not possible that each receive according to what he is adapted to receive?
Furthermore, are all contactees being reached inevitably by the same race? Is it possible that
from one race to another, the message or knowledge may be somewhat different? Are these
different races necessarily at the same level of evolution? And if they are not, could then the
messages or knowledge given to contactees be different according to the goal or elevation of
each race?  

   Personally, as an example, I think that the earth, the sun, etc. are alive at the same level
than a man, with a Soul. I also think that the extraterrestrials are very conscious of it and
communicate also with it. I do not think that they would allow their destructions, as for Them
the earth, the sun, etc. are precious as well if not more than man. Let’s not underestimate
their capacities. They are great. They have the power to save the earth and man and even
restore everything we would be unable to do today. Of course, it is a modest example of what
I can think of. On the other hand, for all that is vibratory, on this, I completely agree with you.

I would say that it is like a wave that would resonate at 100 of frequency and even reached
at 99, that would not pass but at 100, everything goes off very rapidly. Then, the one who
manages in a way or another to resonate at the right vibratory wave, the extras will manifest
quickly.  This concerns,  I  think,  what  you call  the contactees in  my opinion.  But  it  is  also
possible to see some if the person is simply at the right time, in the right place. Nevertheless,
there will be only observation and not telepathy, etc.

Cordially

P.S.  Small reflection: The human being uses only a tiny part of his capacities as, precisely,
his carnal mind stays terrestrial for the moment. But as soon as he will reach a cosmic level,
he will  forcibly use more of his capacities, as for example, heal himself by spirit  etc. The
universe is also governed by ordained laws. I  think that man, as our solar system, is an
integral part of this body that is the universe and he is able to heal himself in full. As some
say, we are a virus and the universe knows how to intervene and regulate all this. It will surely
not let in its body a disease propagate, as us, if we would have the capacity to intervene in
ourselves consciously. I do not know if I am clear in my comments. The human being makes a
whole  with  the  universe and the universe  has all  its  abilities.  We should not  necessarily
confound with our own way of seeing things with its limits. The universe, without any problem,
will make of us what it wishes as we are in its body. There is no worry to have. The man will
end up integrating this whole and take his true role in that body. Then, from virus, the universe
will be able to transform it in vaccine. It is a lot more intelligent than to destroy. Once more, it
is only a way also to see things.



Your message is a nod to a warning about the fact that we can self-destruct etc. I would
personally say no because before we even dare use nuclear power, they will have the abilities
to block and remotely disable everything. It is from this that I allow myself to say, with no
offense to anyone, that they have the ability to anticipate and achieve their goals. Let us
remember that they are a lot more intelligent than humans at this moment.

     Naja

    Hello Ezech.

Thank you for your reflections which demonstrate an inner sensibility and depth.

With  respect  to  transmitted  messages which  you  might  not  have  understood  well,  the
extras have decided that all abducted or contacted persons would receive an identical basic
message  warning  them  of  a  potential  risk  of  self-destruction  of  the  human  race.  The
information could have been picked up and interpreted by each to his understanding. From
that, if the person wanted to go further and establish a real dialogue with Them, this was
possible if the other party would also be interested. As for the number of extraterrestrial races
that are around us at this moment, they are limited to about 5 basic ones and as many who
collaborate from afar. Do not forget that the earth is at this moment under high surveillance
because of the nuclear power and that a vast territory has been circumscribed. Nobody can
enter in this solar system until  further notice and the mandated races to protect you from
yourself make their decisions jointly. Their actions and their diffusions are identical according
to  higher  instructions.  Since  according  to  Them,  the situation  is  serious,  no  improvised
personal initiative from an individual or group is authorized and tolerated without an official
agreement. I could even say that everything starts from above.

I encourage you to read, if this is not already done, in the theory section ‘Do not read this if
you are a believer like me’ where I go further in my reflection on the messages sent by Them.
I will say something here that is a little disturbing but which completes well this intervention.
The messages received, either from the Pleadians, Cirius, Orion, Ramtha, Kryon, the violet
ray, Asthar, Michael and even from Jesus, have value only by the depth of the content of their
messages and their power to transform us into a better being. The veracity of their origins is
for me to be put in parentheses because some beings are ready, if needed, to lie to us on
many levels for us to wake up. Some will also take the appearance of what they believe the
most  likely  to  influence  us  therefore  convince  us.  It  is  then  only  in  the  content  of  their
messages that we can identify their worthy or condemnable intentions. Does the information
create an ill-being or well-being? They are even ready to make believe to an individual without
malice that they are the reincarnation of Christ if that can make him want to convert all his
fellows to his cause (which is theirs). I speak knowingly from the fact that I have been, in my
long life, around many elected ones and many Jesus. It is not by mockery or vice they do it
but because they consider us as children not yet able to understand all their real reasons or
actions. Are they wrong to think that? I don’t comment on that.  

It is my vision
Colin Christian



    Reflection from Ezech

    Hello Colin
   

 Yes,  for sure, I  think they have a common goal  and then, naturally,  I  think a base, a
common message. But personally, from my part, I did not receive that message but, without
saying,  the human being is intelligent  enough to understand it  himself.  I  think that  I  had
already understood it by myself before even their visit. I am a believer also and I understand
very well what you are referring to. It is unfortunate, yes, that in all religions, I think that there
are illuminates who automatically think they are Jesus or other as Buddha, etc. It is often as in
reincarnation, many say to you that you are the reincarnation of a famous person but rarely
the one of a simple peasant, etc. I have gone through a little the 17 pages of your book. It is
interesting and it is good that you can write down what in fact you receive from inside. But if
they are counting on me… I am a pretty poor ambassador.  Looking forward.  Colin.

    Question from Ummo

    Hello Colin Christian.

    It is interesting what you are telling in your story but I have a question all the same which I
have always wondered. It might be ridiculous for some but I ask it anyway. I will try to explain.
When a relative of your family (father or mother) in their youth saw a UFO style mother ship or
simply a circular vessel and that, years after, one of their children or many members of the
family see also a UFO, is it a chance or a coincidence? Is there any link and has this been
planned that a few years later the UFOs would come back to show themselves again? Is it
lucky  to simply see them again or is it premeditated by them?

    Colin

    Hello Ummo

    To see UFOs can be quite common if you live in the country or if you love looking at the sky
often. A distant observation or a very close one does not have the same significance and
impact. Nevertheless, some families of humans are under surveillance from the extras and
such over several generations. We must not doubt any more that one of the investigation
fields of the extras is genetics and the research of candidates who have the most potential
according to their experiment criteria. I will add that the extras research the terrestrials who
have kept the most intact possible the genetic baggage from the start of their creation and
that must be verified on many generations. For some, the surveillance results in an abduction.
There  are  many  testimonies  of  people  that  know  they  were  abducted  and  who  have
discovered with  astonishment  that  their  parents  were  also:  Others,  with  horror,  that  their
children continued that perturbing relation. Despite the drawbacks, we must believe that all
this is done in a humanitarian purpose to save the splendid race we are. At this moment, it is
the good intentions that prevail but we must exercise our discernment in all circumstances.
Being under surveillance can imply also that we are chosen for a vast project of safeguard
which we can’t imagine in its implications.

  The near  observation  from UFO inter-generation  is  one thing  and having  doubts  on  a
possible abduction is another.  Only you know the answer.



    It is my vision
    Colin Christian
 

    Reflection from Ummo

    Hello Christian

   What you are saying makes me wonder in the sense that my mother and me, it is exactly
like that. My mother is followed the same as me. So, the fact that you are talking about this…
Do you know more about why?

   Thank you for your answer as it is an interesting one. From my part, I do not really know if
was abducted but I would be inclined to say no. But once in my life, I saw strange persons; a
blond couple all  dressed in  black on the street.  They were not  moving,  staying  still  and
laughing.  At  times,  they were  smiling  while  looking  at  people  walking  ahead of  them.  In
passing near them, I had a strange sensation as if I knew that they were not coming from our
planet. I asked myself the question in my head like what if you are sisters or brothers from
space (let’s say it like this), look at me and give me a sign. They turned towards me with a
smile, a wink and a yes sign with the head. I was surprised at that moment as I did not really
believe that they would turn around.

    Colin

    Hello Ummo

   Your experience is very interesting even if we do not have the whole context. If you were
able to doubt their belonging to another world, it is a sign that you are not completely stranger
to  the  extraterrestrial  phenomena as  most  people  would  have  seen only  two  eccentrics,
nothing else. Your sensibility to Them should be something to explore.

    Ummo

   
   Thank you again for your explanation but I am curious however to know. What do you mean
when you say that my sensibility towards Them should be something to explore?

    Colin

    Hello Ummo
   
   What I wanted to say by something to explore, it is that if your adventure is real, you may
consider making contact with them. First, you have doubted that the two eccentric persons
could be extraterrestrials so you have an inclination to perceive them. Second, they have
perceived  your  thoughts  about  them so they are  also  receptive  to  you.  This  makes two
components which suggest that a communication can be established. From this observation
and the fact that you come on this forum dedicated principally to extras, you have the basic
ingredients to go further if you wish to do so. By digging a little inside you, you should find
leads that will  enlighten you on the reason of this interest and the next steps to consider.



There is no coincidence. There are only mechanisms of the universe that we have not yet
discovered.

    Question from Vi-Vi

    A very interesting book with a rich and complex material content in a simplified format and
accessible to all!

   Do you have information concerning the events that some predict on the subject of our
planet for the coming years; meaning natural disasters, change of ‘density’ ascension and all
subjects covered in the new age literature?

    Did you read the book ‘Belzebub’s Tales to his Grandson’ from Gurdjieff’? This book states,
in an allegoric and cryptic way, certain details explained in your book but it is also a tool to
connect with your superior self; that is where comes my questioning relative to the boundary
which could exist between your story and any form of truth in relation with our creators.

    And at last, does your material come only from the source or has it been cross-checked
with other materials (in order to verify the validity of your information)?

  This  work  goes  nothing  less  against  the  Darwin  theory  which  is  no  small  thing  and
nevertheless, it seems much closer to the ‘truth’.

    I’ve enjoyed reading your book as it has allowed me to reconnect to a sense of universal
logic which is deeply rooted in each of us.

   Oh yes, I have a last question. If it would be possible to meet Naja in his human form,
according to you, what would he look like?

   
     Hello Vi-vi

   Thank you for your personal message and testimony. I will try to give my feedback next
week-end.

   Sorry for not having answered your questions sooner. On another site, I was bombarded
with questions during two weeks regarding my book and could not supply answers to all.
Furthermore, I write mainly on week-ends because of my other passions, teaching, painting,
music, etc. So, thank you for your patience and your bringing me back to order. I am not too
familiar with forums. I have had the internet for only approximately 5 years. There are people
who are riveted on their computer day and night and who ask questions.  If you do not answer
them within 15 minutes, they start to accuse you of eluding or hiding things. If the delay is
even longer, they move to insults. I believe I am free of my actions and have a life outside the
internet.

     At first, I thank you for your testimony on my book which shows that you have captured its
relevance. As for future events that many prophesy, I fell into that trap when I was 20 years
old (40 years ago already) and I was saying a lot of things back then. I am more discreet now.
First, to perceive the future of a person is problematic as outside a certain number of key



events in someone’s life, the rest is in perpetual transformation. It is easy to predict the future
of a person who is subject to influences and returns of all his past emanations but it is more
difficult when the person controls his life and makes new choices every day. The more we
control our destiny, the more we define it at each present moment. The same goes for the
future of the planet and its inhabitants.  The population is shared between the predictable
taxpayers and the unpredictable creators. So, how predict the future of a population as varied.
Who could decide of our future between the two? It is not all play.

  Even the earth,  as consciousness, can also decide to get rid of  a few millions of fleas
sucking  its  blood.  We  are  dependent  on  our  planetary  environment  and  limited  in  our
evolution by its location in space. Our planet is itself really limited in its ascension by its exact
position in space; meaning by the vibratory content of its immediate environment. Is the earth
really rising itself to a vibratory level or are superior beings bombarding us at this moment
with evolutionary rays? I would lean more for the second hypothesis. I no longer risk today
playing the prophet. I am content to live in the eternal present and I like to think that I will be
able to adapt to whatever the future holds for me. 

     As for the book from Gurdjieff, I have not read it even if I do know the title. My readings are
not all so advanced. It would be too long to list them even if there are not so many. You must
understand that inspired writing, as for my book, is realized without any conscious intellectual
reflection. The original draft of 100 pages of this first book was written in only three days. My
few readings in the paranormal field in my youth have allowed me simply to have access to
different or new concepts and to develop a very open mind. Thus, by creating in me a fertile
soil,  this  has  allowed  the  entity  Naja,  who  expresses  himself  through  me,  to  draw  a
vocabulary and relevant ideas to pass on or complete. It  is l ike answering you here; this
mostly requires me to  make an effort  to  silence my intellect  and write  under  his  dictate:
Because, on a daily basis, I am a simple human, no more.

   Nothing in my book has been confronted with other sources but relies on what I  have
unconsciously  stored  as  baggage  throughout  the  years.  I  have  always  had  the  ease  to
complement other people’s ideas, make the links which connect them and develop globalizing
concepts. An inner voice speaks to me always, validates my reflections and makes me see
where is the truth of the moment; all this without too much effort. As an artist, I am used to let
myself  be guided by my intuition. My creative side allows me to be open to all  forms of
inspiration without judgment a priori. I should also point out that, by having renewed contact
with  many  of  my  past  lives,  this  gives  me  access  quite  easily  to  all  their  baggage  of
experiences. When I need certain abilities, I plug into a life that has developed them.

    As for the appearance of Naja, I never asked myself the question because he does not
have a physical body any more at this moment and is at the fifth level of vibratory evolution of
our world. His original appearance when he lived on his planet was never addressed. In the
book, he mentions that if one of his own kind would stand up in front of you, he would seem to
be made of liquid light in a perpetual metamorphosis. On the other hand, the name Naja was
given by humans to a family of snakes in remembrance of beings half-man/half-snake as part
of their legends. It could be that he might have had a reptilian morphology in his long life but
given the bad press that people make of that race (rightly or wrongly), I don’t go too deep in
that direction.

    If I have stopped responding to comments on the other exchange site and even to go there,



it is because it was turning to a trial on the origin of the name Naja. In a past life, having been
accused of witchcraft by the inquisition for having treated people with energies, then tortured
and burned, I do not laugh at allusions of a snake as a representative of Satan. If people are
having fun by uttering malicious innuendoes on a casual tone, me, I am weighing my words. I
am sensitive to inquisitors who sometimes hide themselves under insignificant appearances. I
will  not be accused of making a deal with the devil twice. Moreover, as far as I know, all
women named Lucy are not the daughters of Lucifer. I take pleasure in answering questions,
in my time limits,  but I  will  not justify myself  in front of a jury.  In the global universe, the
science of names and their vibratory effects is much older than the restricted knowledge of
terrestrials. I rely more on emanations of beings than their appearances or their descriptive
names. This is an asset when one wants to interact with extras of all origins. 

    I hope that my answers satisfy you for now otherwise I am at your disposal but…at my own
pace.

    It is my vision
    Colin Christian

    Colin

    Hello Ezech
   

    I will try to say more on the origin of the human race but I suggest you read my manuscript
that says a lot on the subject. First, we must accept the concept that we are not born of the
fruit of a long evolution but of a transplant on the earth done by a race of extraterrestrials
whose mandate is to spread life in all its forms in the universe. What we believe to be the
natural evolution is in fact a return to our origins. Thus we are going backwards of the primary
evolution. The conscious life is born, at first, where the original creative energy is the most
dense near the fixed center of the universe and second, near the fixed center of the galaxies.
It has deployed hereafter more and more further in the worlds more and more obscure. We
live  in  periphery of  our  own galaxy  and are  one  of  the  last  bastions  where  can  live  an
intelligent race despite the poor atmosphere in primary substance. A certain primitive life can
be born on a planet by the influx of components coming from space. But when the conditions
are conducive to a more elaborate life, it is always transplanted by superior beings whose
mission and passion it  is.  We are somewhat the extreme materialization of a conscience
which wants to explore the dense matter in all its forms to, afterwards, want go back towards
the source with its achievements while becoming once again more and more subtle.

    The extras who thereby plant life on planets are also observers, guardians of their creation.
They ensure that the behaviors of their progeny can be in constant evolution; by correcting
stagnations, by circumscribing the degenerations, etc. If a race risks a self-destruction (as
us), they can decide to save pertinent specimens as precious heritage so they will look for
those who have kept as pure as possible the finer qualities of the creation. They will collect
maybe, if  necessary,  essential  components.  Many individuals can be also studied in their
natural environment or in a chosen place. All this is said for you to understand that the range
of their behaviors is similar to the terrestrial one towards many animal races. In fact, it is from
Them, our Creators, that we have inherited, among others, this passion for the study in depth
of our living area including all flora and existing fauna. For certain terrestrials, the safekeeping



of all that patrimony is as important as for the extras.

   From this postulate, if you accept it and if your research is sincere, you might be able
maybe to have answers from their part to understand what seems to be appropriate to you.

    It is my vision
    Colin Christian

    Comment from Arcane.

    No but Colin is sincere with respect to his abilities to understand what others communicate.

    Colin

    Hello Arcane

  Thank you for your remark. It is true that I try to be the most sincere as possible in my
interventions while  being conscious that  I  am only an intermediary with  everything that  it
entails. I am not always at the top of my abilities, nor without any risk of tinging, limiting or
even blocking the transmission unconsciously. I  am a human being who lives in a certain
place, at a definite era and in a delimited context. These three elements are enough to put in
perspective all revelation. What matters is what I say gets the attention of some of you in their
actual journey and brings at best positive awareness.

    It is my vision
    Colin Christian

    Colin

    Hello to all.
  
   I will give you here my opinion on what I have learned from Those who talk to me. The
theory of Gods coming from heaven who have brought us on earth a long time ago is true. In
the case of our species, we can count approximately 35 thousand years. The problem is that
this race of ‘Gods’ was not in a sector of the universe which was under its jurisdiction and we
were a too evolved prototype for that environment poor in potential. But this being done, it
was decided that,  after a certain time, we would be left  to ourselves by superior decree.
Nevertheless,  many  efforts  were  carried  out  throughout  time,  more  or  less  indirectly,  in
helping us find our true path; meaning realizing our original potential.

   It is also true that as our founding people were not in their authorized area, another race
more conquering (in the bad sense of the word) had claimed that system. There were battles
on several occasions between different factions but superior entities had ruled in favour of the
founding race. That victory did not give, just the same, the right to our Creators to manifest
themselves directly at all times.

   But now that since the 1950s, a new change happened on this earth which resulted in the
involvement here of many extraterrestrial races. All amounts to the atomic energy that man
has discovered and has started to use. Most of you have heard about it but the information is



buried in an overflow of suppositions that goes in all directions. Here is the basis of what I
know. The manipulation and use of atomic energy (nuclear and others) is highly regulated by
superior  orders in  this  part  of  the universe,  even forbidden.  What is  contained in  certain
minerals is energy so concentrated that released too rapidly, it causes a deflagration which
can create a hole in the fabric of our universe. To take a simplistic example, it’s like the anti-
matter coming from an anti-world which, by concentrating too much, freezes, becomes matter
in our world but released too fast regains its primary condition and destroys its contrary in our
world. 

 These  holes  are  very  dangerous  because  they  are  difficult  to  fill,  even  with  an
extraterrestrial  technology.  All  matter  at  all  vibratory  levels  is  destroyed.  If  you  don’t
understand,  it  entails  that  all  form of  destroyed life  by a nuclear  explosion is  annihilated
totally: Even clearer, no possible survival on any vibratory plan, a definite death. Some of
these holes, if they are not caught in time, can cause even more important tears which can
disrupt vast territories. Then, you understand why the extras do not seek to be friends and
laugh with us at this moment. Many worlds are concerned as they are in danger at different
levels.  Faced with  this  threat,  different  peoples  have united.  For  the  moment,  the  whole
atomic arsenal is under their surveillance and their control. Without this threat that weighs on
a very vast territory around the earth, They could have left us in peace in our evolutionary
journey and observe us from afar incognito. They consider our genetic potential so unique
and efficient that They are ready to do anything to save it. From this comes everything you
know about their samples taken on the abductees.
 
     In terms of nuclear power, I do not want to upset anybody but I must say what I know. You
can do whatever you want with it.  If  for 60 years, the extraterrestrials had not intervened
regularly to repair our ‘blunders’, there would be no more forms of life on earth at the present
time. Search on this theme and you will find information.   

    I swear to you that I do not like to say these things but I can’t help myself. When I write and
post  on this  site,  I  don’t  think for  a  second about  what  I’m saying (funny sentence).  I’m
transmitting, that’s all. It is up to you to probe within your inner self to know if the information
gets your attention. From my part,  it  has been a long time since I have no more verified
systematically the sources as I  have over fifty years of experience and reflections on my
reason for being,

    I also hope that my interventions are appreciated and are not seen as pure delirium. They
come simply from the desire to proclaim and enlighten if possible. I say no more as I am
recognized  as  a  motor-mouth  (quality/fault  of  a  teacher)  and  I  do  not  want  to  confuse
anybody, nor appear overly affirmative (too late!).

    It is my vision
    Colin Christian

    Colin

    Hello everybody
   
   This site contains many enriching information thanks to its initiator and in particular to the
testimony of Harmonium 1 that I consider truthful to have myself received similar information



as a whole. We should not discard the fact that we are human beings with some limitations
and unique personalities. The gurus (in the bad sense of the term) do not admit that their
personalities can tinge to different levels the information they receive. Today, even the most
conservative scientists are starting to admit that all experience done in a context cannot be
entirely objective as the experimenter is part of the experiment.

    This reminds me of a hypnotherapist and American author (whose name I don’t remember
but  I  have read one of  his  books a  few years  ago)  who  had practiced several  hypnotic
regressions on hundreds of abductees. His broad conclusions boiled down to the principal
fact that the ETs were practicing those abductions in order to create a hybrid race. But the
problem  is  that  he  lingered  a  lot  describing  sexual  touching  at  the  vaginal  level,  anal,
masturbation of men, forced mating (I quickly understood his field of interest). Sex is always
seller.  What made me unplug completely of  his pseudo-searches,  it  is  during the precise
testimony of a female abductee. That  woman was telling simply that her experience with
extras,  in  her  case,  had  been  positive,  even  enriching  for  her  evolution.  But  she  was
answered by the author ‘But Madam, it is not possible! They are evil beings who raped you’.
This behaviour describes very well the lack of objectivity of some researchers who seek to
bring their experiences into the narrow mold of preconceived  ideas.

    This testimony of Harmonium 1 is what led me to start to testify on this site. Despite a few
remarks of some who have easy doubt, the whole is respectful  of the testimonies. In the
charter, it is forbidden to judge or question a priori a testimony. But it should be also forbidden
to suggest to a witness, who does not mention intense fears, that his experience is due to
beings with unhealthy intentions and that tips can be suggested to prevent them. That is what
I  have read in some comments under the guise of wanting to help.  There are too many
ufology organizations which are under the leadership of persons which have at the starting
point  a  negative  bias  on  the  extraterrestrials  and  which  influence  any  search  for  truth.
However, this site is in general objective and respectful of this.

It is my vision
Colin Christian

Hello everyone.

    It is difficult for me to comment on the cases of traumatic abduction, even violent physically.
In my case, I have always felt respected and even protected as if ‘They’ looked out for me. It
is also true that I felt a few times a suspicious presence who could have been ‘dangerous’
without that protection.

Here is an extract of a testimony from Simplicity that contains elements which caught my
attention and which go in that direction.

Why were they in the area?

For an exploratory mission as they are, above all, explorers. And they have specified not
wanting to do any harm to humans; that the approach of animals was easier…humans being
afraid of all!

Had they done abductions before?



Yes, but they didn’t really make them anymore… That it was the only way to do…because
humans are afraid of contacts. Since our magnetic fields are different from theirs…They have
explained that during past abductions, They lost their identities facing panicked people (Ex: if
the abducted person was afraid to be hurt, They did what the person thought). From there
arise bad experiences for Them…and for the abductees.

    This reflection is very interesting. The majority of earthlings are naturally pacific and helpful
but, in front of the behaviour of a distraught individual in crisis and even aggressive out of
control, who can tell what our spontaneous reactions would be.

It is my vision
Colin Christian

    Hello Doris.

Thank you for your comment. I would like to specify that to emphasize on karma which is
addressed in a paragraph from a text of 12 pages does not do justice to the entire content.
Nevertheless, you must know that karma is not a law governed by any superior entity or any
other judge who distributes penalties or rewards in relation to our actions. But it is well  a
fundamental principle of the universe which is quite impersonal, immutable and constant. It
consists of everything we emit with a certain force; either by a gesture, a word, a thought or
an emotion, will spread around in the form of vibration but at the end of its momentum will
return inexorably towards the one who has emitted it. There, that’s all!  On that basis, the
return shock will be a carrier of knowledge on our real identity. Therefore, it is not advisable to
stay frozen in a victim role or to live a sterile guilt and, even less, to completely put the blame
on exterior circumstances. But if our feeling of guilt or hate brings us to become aware of our
responsibility as creator of our own universe, this will bring really durable changes.

    Earthlings are lucky and at the same time unlucky to have such a wide range of emotions
but we must not believe that the Greys, who have especially a developed mind, do not have a
palette of mental nuances as rich as the one of emotions. The expressions of love do not
manifest only in the range of emotions but well in all frequency scales including the mental
one. Those who want to open up to other extraterrestrial  realities must put necessarily in
parentheses their points of view, their terrestrial landmarks related to an era, a place and a
situation. They  must understand that there are other behaviour references in the universe
which can confuse at first sight but which are also valuable. To define the extraterrestrial
races as either positive or negative is issued of our media which simplifies everything into
opposite poles without intermediate nuances. If I ask you the question: Are the terrestrials a
good or a bad race? You would not know what to answer unless you are extremists in one
way or another.  You see the absurdity of this question: Openness and understanding towards
extraterrestrials is what is asked of terrestrials and this is the motivation that inspired me for
this text.

Addition sept. 2019

All  this  information  is  the  transcription  of  reflections  from  Naja  and  me  that  I  have
transmitted on a site/forum at the beginning of my public manifestation in 2010 and at the
same time is the conclusion of 10 years of public interventions. I have decided to withdraw for
a while in order to regain my inner balance and concentrate on my own personal journey.



I am inhabited by an extraterrestrial entity who has had a long life course and who no
longer feels the duty to manifest in public. He is no more obliged, in this period of his passage
on the earth, to prolong his contacts with humans. In a distant past, he had for a long time the
function of being a mediator to resolve conflicts, the prolonged discords between individuals,
factions or peoples about beliefs, lifestyles or simple divergent opinions. He was going from
planet to planet where help was needed and was called for his expertise. He practised this
profession because he was inhabited at the origin with a particular vibration who gave him the
faculty of bringing out in the other all the possible issues and mainly the secret intentions
behind  appearances.  His  strong  energy  in  him  made  him  come  out,  without  making
necessarily a voluntary action from his part, what was hidden by the protagonists; mainly what
was important for the understanding of the real reasons for conflicts. He could, that way, find
the solutions most adequate in the circumstances. 

So,  because  of  his  presence  in  me,  I  have  frequently  provoked  to  others  extreme
behaviours in all  possible directions. Only by my presence, if  individuals had also a dark
unmentionable part in them, they felt the need to express it. I believe, nevertheless, that this
often came out without the person having any apparent control over his actions. So, I have
known and been through all my life, and without wanting it, extreme reactions from beings
who felt obliged to exteriorize feelings, very strong perturbing emotions.

In  numerous  situations  where  I  have  engaged  with  human  beings,  there  were  often
persons to come and upset, counteract my attempts of collaboration. These behaviours, often
disproportionate in relation to the situation, have worn me out in the long run and made me
suspicious. This forces me, at the age of 67 years, to withdraw from the public scene in order
to stop being subjected again to attacks of all kinds.

Solitude  is  my  healthy  lot  so  I  can  continue  to  evolve  without  fear  of  further  major
disturbances.

 
Nearly two hundred years ago, a journalist while visiting an artist-painter, who was retired

and living in the country, asked him why this lonely life and if it did not hide a mistrust, even a
hatred of the human race. The artist answered no, that he loved humans but he did not want
to associate with them so as not to hate them. This artist-painter, that was me but in another
life. This sentence, despite its humorous side, seems hard, even a value judgment but it is all
I can say about my current situation. Even if I meet many wonderful beings, the wickedness of
some affects a lot and forces me to distance myself globally. At this moment, I  build and
rebuild myself day by day and there ends my visions.

Those were my visions
Colin Christian Chabot


